
Identify various learning needs and 
methods

Develop strategies to address learning 
needs to accomplish the intended 
learning goals (mentorship, lecture 
style, problem-based learning, 
collaborative learning, etc)

Create educational material relevant 
content to meet learning objectives 
(lecture, facilitated discussion, learning 
through practical activities, etc).

Integrate technology (use of digital 
software for visual learning, embedding 
videos and activities, video conferencing 
or webinars, etc)

Incorporate various teaching methods 
that include both formal and practical 
content to address learning needs and 
accomplish learning objectives

Develop both practical activities to 
enhance learning for the participants

IPAC LEAD AS
AN EDUCATOR!

Great educators use
different learning styles,

what’s yours?
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Facilitate skills to promote learning, 
problem solving and behaviour change

Evaluate teaching methods and assess 
learning outcomes to improve for future 
teaching sessions

Collaborate with stakeholders to plan, 
create and implement education

Utilize a supportive learning environment 
that encourages feedback and self 
reflection to strengthen skills and practice

BENEFITS
TO THE HOME
Build Strong Leadership & Confidence
Practical, Hands-On Learning
Compliance & Risk Reduction
Customized Training for Your Home’s Needs
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